



Project Name: Brookview Swim Club Demolition and Site Work

Bid No.: 2021-001

Estimated Cost: \$181,387.50

Bid Opening: 2/22/2021

	<b>Contractor</b>	<b>Base Bid</b>	<b>Alt 1</b>	<b>Alt 2</b>	<b>Awarded</b>
<b>1</b>	Badger Construction	\$111,431.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	Yes
<b>2</b>	Advanced Demolition Services	\$126,896.55	\$12,000.00	\$16,000.00	No
<b>3</b>	Steve R. Rauch, Inc	\$139,371.00	No Bid	Included	No
<b>4</b>	Charles Jergens Construction	\$144,006.25	(\$3,000.00)	\$5,000.00	No
<b>5</b>	Evans landscaping	\$155,027.50	\$0.00	\$6,500.00	No

<b>6</b>	Tall View Palladium, Inc.	\$157,727.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	No
<b>7</b>	A1 Land Development	\$158,550.00	No Bid	No Bid	No
<b>8</b>	O'Rourke Wrecking Company	\$159,605.00	\$25,000.00	\$15,000.00	No
<b>9</b>	Performance Site Development	\$163,034.50	No Bid	No Bid	No
<b>10</b>	Baumann Enterprises, Inc.	\$166,800.95	(\$15,000.00)	Included	No
<b>11</b>	Roxanna Clearing & Demo, LLC	\$185,830.95	\$41,000.00	\$18,000.00	No
<b>12</b>	FCS Construction Services, Inc.	\$189,952.00	No Bid	No Bid	No
<b>13</b>	TC Holzen, Inc.	\$193,389.00	\$30,000.00	No Bid	No